

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL FOR: Purchase and Installation of Well Pumps and Motors at H2Oak Brackish Groundwater Desalination Plant  
 TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 24, 2018  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Alsay, Inc.  
 3359 SE Loop 410  
 San Antonio, TX 78222

Weisinger Incorporated  
 P.O. Box 909  
 Willis, TX 77378

Hydro Resources

1.	<b>Pump: Fabricate and deliver pumping unit (includes coating) in accordance with specifications</b>			
	1 LS BGD-05 Type 316 Cast Stainless Bowls)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	89,550.00 89,550.00	46,700.00 46,700.00
	1 LS BGD-06 (Cast Iron, ASTM A48, Class 30)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	62,550.00 62,550.00	47,300.00 47,300.00
	1 LS BGD-07 (Cast Iron, ASTM A48, Class 30)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	54,160.00 54,160.00	47,300.00 47,300.00
	1 LS BGD-08 (Cast Iron, ASTM A48, Class 30)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	53,980.00 53,980.00	49,300.00 49,300.00
	1 LS BGD-09 (Cast Iron, ASTM A48, Class 30)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	68,010.00 68,010.00	58,100.00 58,100.00
	1 LS BGD-11 (Cast Iron, ASTM A48, Class 30)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	60,260.00 60,260.00	47,300.00 47,300.00
	1 LS BGD-12 (Cast Iron, ASTM A48, Class 30)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	60,260.00 60,260.00	47,300.00 47,300.00
	<b>TOTAL FOR ITEM 1</b>	TOTAL	448,770.00	343,300.00
2.	<b>Additional Column Piping: Fabricate, Deliver (includes coating) and install with existing column pipe in accordance with specifications (see NOTE 1)</b>			
	3,000+/- LF Additional column pipe sections for BGD-05, 06, 07, 08, 09, 11 and 12	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	91.00 273,000.00	101.00 303,000.00
	<b>TOTAL FOR ITME 2</b>	TOTAL	273,000.00	303,000.00
3.	<b>Line Shaft: Fabricate and Deliver (includes couplings and bearings) in accordance with specifications (see NOTE 2)</b>			
	6,520+/- LF Line shaft for BGD-05, 06, 07, 08, 09, 11 and 12	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	80.00 521,600.00	89.00 580,280.00
	<b>TOTAL FOR ITME 3</b>	TOTAL	521,600.00	580,280.00
4.	<b>300-hp Electric Motor: Fabricate and Deliver (includes coating) in accordance with specifications (see NOTE 3)</b>			
	1 LS BGD-05	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	53,440.00 53,440.00	39,000.00 39,000.00
	1 LS BGD-06	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	53,440.00 53,440.00	39,000.00 39,000.00
	1 LS BGD-07	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	53,440.00 53,440.00	39,000.00 39,000.00
	1 LS BGD-08	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	53,440.00 53,440.00	39,000.00 39,000.00

**NO BID**

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL FOR: Purchase and Installaation of Well Pumps and Motors at H2Oak Brackish Groundwater Desalination Plant  
 TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 24, 2018  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Alsay, Inc.  
 3359 SE Loop 410  
 San Antonio, TX 78222

Weisinger Incorporated  
 P.O. Box 909  
 Willis, TX 77378

Hydro Resources

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	PRICE	TOTAL	
	1 LS BGD-09	PRICE	53,440.00	39,000.00	NO BID
		TOTAL	53,440.00	39,000.00	
	1 LS BGD-11	PRICE	53,440.00	39,000.00	
		TOTAL	53,440.00	39,000.00	
	1 LS BGD-12	PRICE	53,440.00	39,000.00	
		TOTAL	53,440.00	39,000.00	
	<b>TOTAL FOR ITME 4</b>	<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>374,080.00</b>	<b>273,000.00</b>	
<b>5.</b>	<b>Additional Components for the System including lubrication pump and motor (if required)</b>				
	1 LS BGD-05	PRICE	9,000.00	10,000.00	
		TOTAL	9,000.00	10,000.00	
	1 LS BGD-06	PRICE	9,000.00	10,000.00	
		TOTAL	9,000.00	10,000.00	
	1 LS BGD-07	PRICE	9,000.00	10,000.00	
		TOTAL	9,000.00	10,000.00	
	1 LS BGD-08	PRICE	9,000.00	10,000.00	
		TOTAL	9,000.00	10,000.00	
	1 LS BGD-09	PRICE	9,000.00	10,000.00	
		TOTAL	9,000.00	10,000.00	
	1 LS BGD-11	PRICE	9,000.00	10,000.00	
		TOTAL	9,000.00	10,000.00	
	1 LS BGD-12	PRICE	9,000.00	10,000.00	
		TOTAL	9,000.00	10,000.00	
	<b>TOTAL FOR ITME 5</b>	<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>63,000.00</b>	<b>70,000.00</b>	
<b>6.</b>	Removal of existing electric motor and pump components including column pipe, pump bowl, and line shaft				
	1 LS BGD-05	PRICE	5,400.00	14,700.00	
		TOTAL	5,400.00	14,700.00	
	1 LS BGD-06	PRICE	5,400.00	14,700.00	
		TOTAL	5,400.00	14,700.00	
	1 LS BGD-07	PRICE	5,400.00	14,700.00	
		TOTAL	5,400.00	14,700.00	
	1 LS BGD-08	PRICE	5,400.00	14,700.00	
		TOTAL	5,400.00	14,700.00	
	1 LS BGD-09	PRICE	5,400.00	14,700.00	
		TOTAL	5,400.00	14,700.00	

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL FOR: Purchase and Installaation of Well Pumps and Motors at H2Oak Brackish Groundwater Desalination Plant  
 TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 24, 2018  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Alsay, Inc.  
 3359 SE Loop 410  
 San Antonio, TX 78222

Weisinger Incorporated  
 P.O. Box 909  
 Willis, TX 77378

Hydro Resources

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	6,300.00	16,600.00	NO BID
	1 LS BGD-11	TOTAL	6,300.00	16,600.00	
	1 LS BGD-12	TOTAL	6,300.00	16,600.00	
	<b>TOTAL FOR ITME 6</b>	TOTAL	39,600.00	106,700.00	
7.	<b>Assemble and install pumping unit, components described above, and lube line in accordance with specifications</b>				
	1 LS BGD-05	TOTAL	11,125.00	24,800.00	
	1 LS BGD-06	TOTAL	11,125.00	25,300.00	
	1 LS BGD-07	TOTAL	12,250.00	29,100.00	
	1 LS BGD-08	TOTAL	12,250.00	29,100.00	
	1 LS BGD-09	TOTAL	12,250.00	29,100.00	
	1 LS BGD-11	TOTAL	11,125.00	25,300.00	
	1 LS BGD-12	TOTAL	11,125.00	25,300.00	
	<b>TOTAL FOR ITME 7</b>	TOTAL	81,250.00	188,000.00	
8.	<b>Field Acceptance Testing</b>				
	1 LS BGD-05	TOTAL	2,000.00	2,245.00	
	1 LS BGD-06	TOTAL	2,000.00	2,245.00	
	1 LS BGD-07	TOTAL	2,000.00	2,245.00	
	1 LS BGD-08	TOTAL	2,000.00	2,245.00	
	1 LS BGD-09	TOTAL	2,000.00	2,245.00	
	1 LS BGD-11	TOTAL	2,000.00	2,245.00	

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL FOR: Purchase and Installaation of Well Pumps and Motors at H2Oak Brackish Groundwater Desalination Plant  
 TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 24, 2018  
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Alsay, Inc.  
 3359 SE Loop 410  
 San Antonio, TX 78222

Weisinger Incorporated  
 P.O. Box 909  
 Willis, TX 77378

Hydro Resources

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	2,000.00	2,245.00	NO BID
	1 LS BGD-12	TOTAL	2,000.00	2,245.00	
	<b>TOTAL FOR ITME 8</b>	TOTAL	14,000.00	15,715.00	
	<b>TOTAL BID PRICING FOR ITEMS 1-8</b>	TOTAL	<b>1,815,300.00</b>	1,879,995.00	
	Terms		Net 30 days	2% 10 days	
	Delivery Days		84 days	180 days	

**\*LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Alsay  
 Andrews-Foster  
 Conhagen  
 Davenport Drilling  
 DXP  
 Layne  
 Peerless Equipment  
 Pump Solution  
 SA Armature  
 Smith Pump  
 Weisinger Inc.

Demandstar  
 SAWS Website